
PLUTO CONJUNCT NATAL NORTH NODE 

 

With Pluto Conjunct Natal North Node some of your personal drives and the road you walk will 
shift.  In many cases, the road you are on will go through significant changes where something 
comes to an end because it no longer suits your evolutionary quest; then, something new begins to 
take shape.  

 

The North Node has to do with your path in life. For example, those with their North Node in the sign 
of Aquarius are here to work towards something of significance that can be used by others to help 
in their advancement. It will have a humanitarian focus.   

 

Many with this aspect will feel the need to leave something behind which can help this shift over 
time, before they pass over into the next phase of evolution beyond this life.  You truly want to make 
a change, and with this aspect in your chart your path may now line up with your endeavors 
surrounding some of your visions.  Do not take this lightly. You have a purpose, and you are to move 
forward with your purpose because the North Node is involved. 

 

As mentioned, the North Node has to do with your path in life and often brings important people 
into your life when you are ready.  They can enter life for short periods of time having a profound 
influence or have a lasting impact by being close for many years to come.  They help you to align 
with your life’s purpose described by the North Node in your chart.  Because this area of life is new, 
its energies are often not very comfortable, especially in the beginning stages.  You, however, must 
pursue this avenue of expression as life will push you in that direction, with or without your consent.   

 

Pluto will give you hints along the way often through subtle means especially when you are first 
beginning this shift but over time you begin to understand the reason behind the changes that have 
come into your life.  Sometimes these changes take place without your consent, as mentioned, 
although on some level you agreed to this lesson prior to entering this life.  Taking some 
responsibility for what is taking place as this is part of the process.  A part of you understands that 
this is exactly what is required so there is no need to fight the process. 

 

The house position of your North Node will give you further information about what to expect and 
where you might be headed. 


